Sales agreement

[ Russell M Hyde agree to purchase hangar units 3H
& 3G located at the Rutherford County Airport
Rutherfordton Rutherford County NC .for the amount
of 70,000 from Heath Taber Hyde of Wellington FL

Dated April 30 2019

Wby ™ Wy b
Signature of Buyer

Signature of Seller



Brooke Watson
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From: Beth Miller <bmiller@etmlawoffice.com>

Sent: Monday, May 13, 2019 3:45 PM

To: Steve Garrison; Brooke Watson

Subject: FW: Hanger purchase

*** Exercise caution. This is an EXTERNAL email. DO NOT open attachments or click links from unknown senders or
unexpected email. ***

Steve,
Please see the below confirmation from Taber Hyde that he is in fact selling Hangars 3G and 3H to Russell Hyde for
$70,000. Beth

Elizabeth T. Miller
Attorney at Law

PO Box 800

346 North Main Street
Rutherfordton, NC 28139
PH: 828-286-8222 Ext 102
FAX: 828-286-8229

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL: This electronic message and any attachments are confidential property of the sender. The information is intended only for the
use of the person to whom it was addressed. Any other interception, copying. accessing. or disclosure of this message is prohibited. The sender takes no
responsibility for any unauthorized reliance on this message. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and purge the message
you received. Do not forward this message without permission.

From: Merrimon Oxley [mailto:mboxleylaw@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, May 09, 2019 10:35 AM

To: Elizabeth T. Miller

Subject: Fwd: Hanger purchase

Beth,

Please see Taber’s e-mail below.
Merri

Merrimon B. Oxley

Wolf & Oxley, PLLC

138 South Broadway St.

Forest City, NC 28043

828-245-7366 / 828-287-3726
fax: 828-245-7359

Begin forwarded message:

From: Taber Hyde <taberflying@gmail.com>




Subject: Re: Hanger purchase
Date: May 8, 2019 at 8:08:08 PM EDT
To: Merrimon Oxley <mboxleylaw@gmail.com>

No warranty. 70000. Thanks.
Taber

Sent from my iPhone

On May 1, 2019, at 12:36 PM, Merrimon Oxley <mboxleylaw@gmail.com>
wrote:

Hi Taber,
[ tried to call but I don’t have the correct phone number.

Anyway, I understand your Dad is purchasing, I think, 2 hangars from you at the
Airport. The Airport Authority got a statement to that effect but is was not
notarized. Would you confirm in an e-mail back to me the terms of the agreement
for the purchase of the hangars and the price.

Thanks, Merri

Merrimon B. Oxley

Wolf & Oxley. PLLC

138 South Broadway St.
Forest City, NC 28043
828-245-7366 / 828-287-3726
fax: 828-245-7359



